
Bid No. Bidder Bid rec'd
1 Cranesville Block 04/28/2026, 1:36 PM



Bid No. 1
Bidder Cranesville Block Co., Inc.
Bid Rec'd 04/28/2026, 1:36 PM
Specs.
Remarks

Item 1:  Ready-Mixed Concrete Class A Albany Division
Bid Price/per cu.yd.

Class A (0-4 miles) $199.00
Class A (5-10 miles) $209.00
Class A (11-20 miles) $219.00
Class A (Over 20 miles) $239.00

Price for Designated Admixtures:
Type A   Water-Reducing Admixtures $4.00
Type C   Water-Reducing Admixtures $12.00
Type D   Water-Reducing and Retarding Admixtures $12.00
Type E   Water-Reducing Admixtures No Bid
Type F   Water-Reducing (High Range) Admixtures               $14.00
Fibrous Concrete Reinforcement $12.00

Surcharges for Small Orders (Flat Rate)
3 Cubic Yards $180.00
4 Cubic Yards $160.00
5 Cubic Yards $130.00
6-6.5 Cubic Yards

ITEM 2: Ready-Mixed Concrete Class C

Class C (0-4 miles) $200.00
Class C (5-10 miles) $210.00
Class C(11-20 miles) $220.00
Class C(Over 20 miles) $240.00

Price for Designated Admixtures:
Type A   Water-Reducing Admixtures $4.00
Type C   Water-Reducing Admixtures $12.00
Type D   Water-Reducing and Retarding Admixtures $12.00
Type E   Water-Reducing Admixtures No Bid
Type F   Water-Reducing (High Range) Admixtures               $14.00
Fibrous Concrete Reinforcement $12.00

Surcharges for Small Orders (Flat Rate)
3 Cubic Yards $180.00
4 Cubic Yards $160.00
5 Cubic Yards $130.00
6-6.5 Cubic Yards



ITEM 3:  Ready-Mixed Concrete Class D

Class D (0-4 miles) $210.00
Class D(5-10 miles) $220.00
Class D(11-20 miles) $230.00
Class D(Over 20 miles) $250.00

Price for Designated Admixtures:
Type A   Water-Reducing Admixtures $4.00
Type C   Water-Reducing Admixtures $12.00
Type D   Water-Reducing and Retarding Admixtures $12.00
Type E   Water-Reducing Admixtures No Bid
Type F   Water-Reducing (High Range) Admixtures               $14.00
Fibrous Concrete Reinforcement $12.00

Surcharges for Small Orders (Flat Rate)
3 Cubic Yards $180.00
4 Cubic Yards $160.00
5 Cubic Yards $130.00
6-6.5 Cubic Yards

ITEM 4:  Ready-Mixed Concrete Class E

Class E (0-4 miles) $204.00
Class E (5-10 miles) $214.00
Class E(11-20 miles) $224.00
Class E (Over 20 miles) $244.00

Price for Designated Admixtures:
Type A   Water-Reducing Admixtures $4.00
Type C   Water-Reducing Admixtures $12.00
Type D   Water-Reducing and Retarding Admixtures $12.00
Type E   Water-Reducing Admixtures No Bid
Type F   Water-Reducing (High Range) Admixtures               $14.00
Fibrous Concrete Reinforcement $12.00

Surcharges for Small Orders (Flat Rate)
3 Cubic Yards $180.00
4 Cubic Yards $160.00
5 Cubic Yards $130.00
6-6.5 Cubic Yards



ITEM 5:  Ready-Mixed Concrete Class F

Class F (0-4 miles) $200.00
Class F (5-10 miles) $210.00
Class F (11-20 miles) $220.00
Class F(Over 20 miles) $240.00

Price for Designated Admixtures:
Type A   Water-Reducing Admixtures $4.00
Type C   Water-Reducing Admixtures $12.00
Type D   Water-Reducing and Retarding Admixtures $12.00
Type E   Water-Reducing Admixtures No Bid
Type F   Water-Reducing (High Range) Admixtures               $14.00
Fibrous Concrete Reinforcement $12.00

Surcharges for Small Orders (Flat Rate)
3 Cubic Yards $180.00
4 Cubic Yards $160.00
5 Cubic Yards $130.00
6-6.5 Cubic Yards

ITEM 6:  Ready-Mixed Concrete Class H

Class H (0-4 miles) $200.00
Class H (5-10 miles) $210.00
Class H (11-20 miles) $220.00
Class H (Over 20 miles) $240.00

Price for Designated Admixtures:
Type A   Water-Reducing Admixtures $4.00
Type C   Water-Reducing Admixtures $12.00
Type D   Water-Reducing and Retarding Admixtures $12.00
Type E   Water-Reducing Admixtures No Bid
Type F   Water-Reducing (High Range) Admixtures               $14.00
Fibrous Concrete Reinforcement $12.00

Surcharges for Small Orders (Flat Rate)

3 Cubic Yards $180.00
4 Cubic Yards $160.00
5 Cubic Yards $130.00
6-6.5 Cubic Yards



ITEM 7:  Ready-Mixed Concrete Class HP

Class HP(0-4 miles) $220.00 
Class HP (5-10 miles) $230.00 
Class HP (11-20 miles) $240.00 
Class HP (Over 20 miles) $260.00 

Price for Designated Admixtures:
Type A   Water-Reducing Admixtures
Type C   Water-Reducing Admixtures $4.00
Type D   Water-Reducing and Retarding Admixtures $12.00
Type E   Water-Reducing Admixtures $12.00
Type F   Water-Reducing (High Range) Admixtures               No Bid
Fibrous Concrete Reinforcement $14.00

$12.00
Surcharges for Small Orders (Flat Rate)
3 Cubic Yards $180.00
4 Cubic Yards $160.00
5 Cubic Yards $130.00
6-6.5 Cubic Yards



ITEM 8:  Ready-Mixed Concrete Class 3000- HES 12-hour 

Class 3000 HES 12 Hour (0-4) $220.00
Class 3000 HES 12 Hour (5-10) $230.00
Class 3000 HES 12 Hour (11-20) $240.00
Class 3000 HES 12 Hour (Over 20 Miles) $260.00

Price for Designated Admixtures:
Type A   Water-Reducing Admixtures $4.00
Type C   Water-Reducing Admixtures $12.00
Type D   Water-Reducing and Retarding Admixtures $12.00
Type E   Water-Reducing Admixtures No Bid
Type F   Water-Reducing (High Range) Admixtures               $14.00
Fibrous Concrete Reinforcement $12.00

Surcharges for Small Orders (Flat Rate)
3 Cubic Yards $180.00
4 Cubic Yards $160.00
5 Cubic Yards $130.00
6-6.5 Cubic Yards

ITEM 9:  Ready-Mixed Concrete Class SCC

Class SCC (0-4) $220.00
Class SCC (5-10) $230.00
Class SCC (11-20) $240.00
Class SCC(Over 20 Miles) $260.00

Price for Designated Admixtures:
Type A   Water-Reducing Admixtures $4.00
Type C   Water-Reducing Admixtures $12.00
Type D   Water-Reducing and Retarding Admixtures $12.00
Type E   Water-Reducing Admixtures No Bid
Type F   Water-Reducing (High Range) Admixtures               $14.00
Fibrous Concrete Reinforcement $12.00

Surcharges for Small Orders (Flat Rate)
3 Cubic Yards $180.00
4 Cubic Yards $165.00
5 Cubic Yards $130.00
6-6.5 Cubic Yards



ITEM 10:  Ready-Mixed Lightweight or Slag Concrete

RM LW/Slag (0-4) $280.00
RM LW/Slag (5-10) $290.00
RM LW/Slag (11-20) $300.00
RM LW/Slag (Over 20 miles) $320.00

Price for Designated Admixtures:
Type A   Water-Reducing Admixtures $4.00
Type C   Water-Reducing Admixtures $12.00
Type D   Water-Reducing and Retarding Admixtures $12.00
Type E   Water-Reducing Admixtures No Bid
Type F   Water-Reducing (High Range) Admixtures               $14.00
Fibrous Concrete Reinforcement $12.00

Surcharges for Small Orders (Flat Rate)
3 Cubic Yards $180.00
4 Cubic Yards $160.00
5 Cubic Yards $130.00
6-6.5 Cubic Yards

Price Additionals

Heated Water

Cost per cubic yard for heated water & aggregate when ordered by the Division Director $15.00
 
    
Unloading Time

Charge per hour for unloading in excess of allowable time $120.00

   
Pumped Concrete

Cost per hour for pumped concrete (port to port) when ordered by the Division Director:  (This 
cost is above and beyond the cost of the materials.)      No Bid

Conveyor Delivery (If available)

Cost per hour for using vendor's conveyors to dispense concrete at a further distance from the 
cement truck.                                             No Bid

  

Optional Aggregates Additional Cost (if any) Bid Price/per cu.yd.
         
Traprock         No bid
Crushed Stone       No Bid
Crushed Gravel No bid
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